"NOTICE

Debts Recovery Tribunal (Procedure) Rules, 1993 & Security
Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002 have been amended vide GOI

Notifications No. GSR 1047(E) dated 3.11.2016 and GSR 1046(E)
dated 3.11.2016, respectively.

All are informed of above amendments in the DRT (Procedure)

Rules, 1993 and Security Interest (Enforce'ment) Rules, 2002, for

compliance.

By Order

> \
\ QT
\\\S - o s

(REGISTRAR)




8 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

11.%%@%(%13%@?{)Wﬂwﬁﬁ?@ﬁéﬁﬁmmmﬁaﬁ?waﬁﬂ:
(i) & =T TR ForaH arehia:
(ii) fewie groe it FeA:
qr
(i) AT e AET(AE) H e
(if) ST AT STHAT T ATH:
(i) TrEeer SET(AER) F ST fg S A A
(iv) 3T STFET
12. farorr =T 1 fee
Rroaeg RIS 3 FATr A e g= 2 wfadt # g 2
13. HevHt T FHI:

R e R S ey S o st i e B e
F1/H /AT, W%Wmﬁwﬁﬁﬁﬁmﬁmmﬁwﬁ%wﬁm/ﬁé% 19
11 3 3 Tl Ao BT ST ST o e & " o 7w A el oft amee qer Ay R a9 2
HTATH % FEATEL

T

arirE:

FaT H,

[T, 5. 3/10/2016-FTem7E]

froqor « wer fAgw 20 R, 2002  Fr.ar. FEAr 1020(.) ¥ qEd IR ¥ qOA F WE-1 @S 3, 39 @e (i) #
seRTERre TR T & ST 26 sz, 2007 HT AT HEAT FTLAT. 1837(3) ¥ daa sifew a1 genfaa frr T 3

NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 3rd November, 2016

G.S.R. 1046(E).—In exercise of powers conferred by sub-section (1) and clause (b) of sub-section (2) of section
38, read with sub-section (4), sub-section (10) and sub-section (12) of section 13 of the Securitisation and Asset
Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (54 of 2002), the Central Government
hereby makes following rules further to amend the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Security Interest (Enforcement) (Amendment)
Rules, 2002.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002, (hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), in rule 3, -
(i) in sub-rule (1), after the word “delivering”, the words, “including hand delivery,” shall be inserted;

(ii) after sub-rule (4), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—



[ TT—@vs 3(i)] I 1 TSI ¢ STHIMRY 9

“(5) The demand notice may invite attention of the borrower to provisions of sub-section (8) of section
13 of the Act, in respect of time available to the borrower, to redeem the secured assets.”. |

3. In the principal rules, in rule 3A,—
(i) in clause (b), for the words “seven days”, the words “fifteen days”, shall be substituted;
(ii) in clause (c), for the words “one week”, the words “fifteen days”, shall be substituted.

4. 1n the principal rules, in rule 4, after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rules shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) The borrower shall be intimated by a notice, enclosing the panchnama drawn in Appendix I and the inventory
made in Appendix IL.

(2B) All notices under these rules may also be served upon the borrower through electronic mode of service, in addition
to the modes specified under rule s

5. Tn the principal rules, in rule 6,—
(i) in sub-rule (1), for clause (¢), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(¢) holding public auction including through e-auction mode; or’’; .
(ii) in sub-rule (2), after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“provided further that if sale of movable property by any one of the methods specified under sub-rule
(1) fails and the sale is required to be conducted again, the authorised officer shall serve, affix and publish
notice of sale of not less than fifteen days to the borrower for any subsequent sale.”;

(iii) in sub-rule (3), for the words “between the parties in writing”, the words “between the secured creditors and
the proposed purchaser”, shall be substituted.

6. In the principal rules, in rule 3,
(i) after sub rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) All notices under these rules may also be served upon the borrower through electronic mode of service, in
addition to the modes prescribed under sub-rule (1) and sub-rule (2) of rule 8.”.

(it) in sub-rule (5), for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(c) by holding public auction including through e-auction mode; or”’;

(iii) in sub-rule (8), for the words “between the parties in writing”, the words “between the secured creditor and
the proposed purchaser in writing”, shall be substituted.

7. In the principal rules, in rule 9,-
(i) for sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) No sale of immovable property under these rules, in first instance shall take place before the expiry of
thirty days from the date on which the public notice of sale is published in newspapers as referred to in the
proviso to sub-rule (6) of rule 8 or notice of sale has been served to the borrower: >

Provided further that if sale of immovable property by any one of the methods specitied by sub rule (5)
of rule 8 fails and sale is required to be conducted again, the authorised officer shall serve, affix and publish
notice of sale of not less than fifteen days to the borrower, for any subsequent sale.”;

(ii) in sub-rule (2), n the proviso, for the word and figure “rule 97, the word and figure “rule 87, shall be
substituted;

(iii) for sub-rule (3), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) On every sale of immovable property, the purchaser shall immediately, i.e. on the same day or not later
than next working day, as the case may be, pay a deposit of twenty five per cent. of the amount of the sale price,
which is inclusive of earnest money deposited, if any, to the authorised officer conducting the sale and in default
of such deposit, the property shall be sold again™;

(iv) in sub-rule (4), for the words “as may be agreed upon in writing between the parties”, the words, “as may
be agreed upon in writing between the purchaser and the secured creditor, in any case not exceeding three
months” shall be substituted;

(v) in sub-rule (5), after the words, “the deposit shall be forfeited”, the words “to the secured creditor” shall be
inserted.

8. Tn the principal rules, after rule 13, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:—



10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(1)]

“13A. Application by lessee or tenant.— (1) Every application under sub-section (1) of section 17 filed by lessee or tenant
of the secured assets shall be accompanied by a fee specified in sub-clause (¢) and sub-clause (d) of sub-rule (2) of rule

13, as the case may be.
(2) The application to be made by the lessee or the tenant under sub-section (1) of section 17, shall be in the form
specified in Appendix X annexed to these rules”.

9. In the principal rules, in Appendix I, after the first paragraph, the following paragraph shall be inserted, namely:—

“The borrower’s attention is invited to provisions of sub-section (8) of section 13 of the Act, in respect of time available,
to redeem the secured assets.”.

10. In the principal rules, in Appendix III, for the word and figure “rule 87, the words and figures “rule 6 and 77, shall be
substituted.

11. In the principal rules, in Appendix IV,—
(i) in the opening paragraph, for the word and figure “rule 97, the word and figure “rule 3” shall be substituted;
(if) for the first paragraph, the following paragraph shall be substituted, namely:-

“The borrower having failed to repay the amount, notice is hereby given to the borrower and the public in
general that the undersigned has taken possession of the property described herein below in exercise of powers
conferred on him under sub-section (4) of section 13 of Act read with rule g of the Security Interest
Enforcement) Rules, 2002 on this the ....... dayiofiss. of the year...... g2

(iii) after the second paragraph, the following paragraph shall be inserted, namely:—

“The borrower’s attention is invited to provisions of sub-section (8) of section 13 of the Act, in respect of time
available, to redeem the secured assets.”.

12. In the principal rules, in Appendix V, for the word and figure “rule 127 the words and figures “rules 8 and 97, shall be
substituted.

13. In the principal rules, after Appendix 1X, the following Appendix shall be inserted, namely:—
«APPENDIX- X
[See rule 14]
(for lessee/tenants)
(Application under sub-section (1) of section 17 read with sub-section (4) of section 17 of the Act)

For use in Tribunal’s Office:
Date of filing «...oovveeveereceeenes
Date of receipt by post ..............
or

Registration number ...............-

SIZNALULE oou.ieoieinne s snees
Registrar
In the Debts Recovery Tribunal
(Name of the place)

Between:
LD v e e T Applicant(s)

And
D e e N Detendant(s)

‘Delete whichever is not applicable.
Details of application:
1. Particulars of applicant:-
(i) Name of applicant:
(ii) Locus of applicant — lessee/ tenant:

(iii) Address of applicant/lessee:



[am —evs 3(3i)] I T SIS : STEERY

1l

(iv) Address for service of all notices:

2. Particulars of the defendant/bank:-
(i) Name of the defendant/ bank:
(ii) Office address of the defendant/bank:
(i) Address for service of all notices:
3. Jurisdiction of the Tribunal:
The applicant declares that the subject matter of this application falls within the jurisdiction of the Tribunal.

4. Limitation:

The applicant further declares that this application is filed within the limitation prescribed in sub-section (1) of

section 17 of the Act.

5. Locus of applicant:

Enumerate herein-nature of locus of applicant under sub-section (1) of section 17 read with section sub-section (4) of

section 17.
(i) Whether the applicant is a lessee or tenant:

(i) If applicant is a lessee or tenant, furnish the following details:

Date of lease deed/agreement of tenancy if any

—

Whether the lease deed/ agreement of tenancy is registered

Details of registration — name of the SRO, document number to be furnished

Amount of rent under the lease deed / agreement of tenancy

Period of lease / tenancy

Whether permission of secured creditor taken

Date of expiry of lease/agreement of rent
Whether lease/tenancy renewed

Copy of lease deed / agreement of tenancy

[ AP

6. Facts of the case :
The facts of the case are given below:-

(Give here a concise statement of facts in a chronological order, each paragraph containing as nearly as
separate issue, fact or otherwise as to how the applicant is aggrieved).

7. Cause of action:
8. Relief(s) sought:

In view of the facts mentioned in paragraph 5 above, the applicant prays for the following relief(s):-

possible a

[Specify below the relief(s) sought explaining the ground for relief(s) and the legal provisions (if any) relied upon as laid

down under sub-section (3) of section 17]

9. Interim order, it prayed for:

Pending final decision on the application, the applicant seeks issue of the following Interim Order:-
(Give here the nature of the interim order prayed for with reasons).

10. Matter not pending with any other court, etc.:

The applicant further declares that the matter regarding which this application has been made is not pending
court of law or any other authority or any other bench of the Tribunal.

11. Particulars of bank draft or postal order in respect of the application fee in terms of [rule 13] of these rules:
(i) Name of the bank on which drawn:
(ii) Demand draft No.:
or
(i) Number of Indian Postal Order(s):
(ii) Name of the issuing post office:

* (iii) Date of issue of postal order(s):

before any



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA: EXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—SEC. 3(i)]

(iv) Post office at which payable:
L}

12. Details of index:
An index in duplicate containing the details of the documents to be relied upon is enclosed.

13. List of enclosures:-

Verification
e e e ol o bdunscso S oo T e G son/daughter/wife of
(Name in full and block letters)

S s s e e , the applicant /for and on behalf of the applicant hereby
solemnly verify that the contents of paragraphs | to 11 are true to my personal knowledge and belief and that I have not
suppressed any material facts.

Signature of the applicant
Place:

Date:

To

The Registrar,

[F. No. 3/10/2016 - DRT]
ANANDRAO V. PATIL, Jt. Secy.

Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number
S.0. 1020 (E), dated the 20" September 2002 and last amended vide notification number S.0. 1837 (E), dated the
26" October 2007.

srfaET
% ey, 3 AaFax, 2016

TrFT.5. 1047 (30). —FET TR A% S ey deaTet 1 siver For A A, 1993 (1993 #1 51)
aﬁmsseﬁw-err{rm)aﬁT(z)amer%ﬁwwﬁvmgq,maqaﬁafwvr(qﬁm)ﬁw, 1993 ¥
siqter 3 oy Freerfea o fam a2, aafa—

1.@3wsﬁwﬁw.—(1)wﬁvﬁwﬁ%wmww«ﬁa@wﬂm) (FeTrar) faw, 2016 21
(Z)ﬁwﬁwsmﬁwrﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁgﬁl
2. 7 g wfeETr (wwaT) AT, 1993 (ﬁf@rmqmwﬁwww%yﬁﬁwzﬁ,-
(i) @< (F) % e o Fetefa Tar s, ERIRH
. (F) warforfRrT & 3 9 T e Y afven s et Afafamw, 1993 (1993 F7 51) afera &)

AT, (FF) “mﬁ%ﬁﬁmﬁ%wﬁmﬁm%ﬁaﬁw%wamw
FTAT £ IT SHHT AT F IR 2187

(i) GE(H)%%QW@@%WWWW%,W:-

(=) “drETEE WﬁWWWWM?WEﬁWWWﬁ%ﬁW?
WWWWWWWWQWW%’;’;

3: Wﬁﬁﬁﬁws%wﬁvw (2) ¥ wemq fFAwerfa 3v-fAaw T FrT SO, erefie-
“(2%)@-%(2)%WW%W%meWIvﬁqﬁwﬁ?ﬁﬁwaﬁrmmw



J 16 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—SEC. 3(i)]

4
,/f / NOTIFICATION
: New Delhi, the 3rd November, 2016

; G.S.R. 1047(E).— In exercise of powers conferred by sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 36 of the Recovery of
Debts due to Banks and Financial Institutions Act, 1993 (51 of 1993), the Central Government hereby makes following
rules further to amend the Debts Recovery Tribunal (Procedure) Rules, 1993, namely:—

| Short title and commencement.—(1) These rules may be called the Debts Recovery Tribunal (Procedure)
(Amendment) Rules, 2016.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.
2 In the Debts Recovery Tribunal (Procedure) Rules, 1993, (hereinafter referred to as the principal rules), in rule 2,-
(i) for clause (a), the following shall be substituted, namely:-

A.  ‘(a) “Act” means the Recovery of Debts due to Banks and Financial Institutions Act, 1993 (51 of
1993);7;

B. ‘(aa) “agent means a person duly authorised by a party to present application or to give reply on its
behalf before the Tribunal;”;

(11) for clause (/). the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—

¢(f) “Presiding Officer” means the Presiding Officer of the Tribunal and includes the Presiding Officer
of any other Tribunal, authorised by the Central Government to discharge the function;’;

3. In the principal rules, in rule 5, after sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2A) After registration of the application under sub-rule (2), the Tribunal shall issue summons to the defendants
in Form IV.”.

4. In the principal rules, in rule 5A, in sub-rule (2) for the words “sixty days”, the words “thirty days” shall be
substituted.

5. In the principal rules, in rule 6, for clause (), the following shall be substituted, namely:—

“(a) the branch or any other office of the applicant is functioning as a bank or financial institution and
maintaining an account in which debt claimed is outstanding for the time being:

Provided that a Debenture Trustee having a claim against any company for redemption of secured debt
securities, shall file an application at the place within whose jurisdiction the Debenture Trustee has its principal
place of business or at the place where secured asset is located. ”.

6. In the principal rules, for rule 12, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“12. Filing of written statement and other documents by the defendant and by the applicant as a reply to the
written statement.— (1) The defendant may, within a period of thirty days from the date of service of summons,
file two complete sets of written statement including claim for set-off or counter claim, if any, along with
documents in a paper book form.

(2) A copy of the written statement filed under sub-rule (1) shall be served to the applicant.

(3) If the defendant fails to file the written statement of his defence, including claim for set off or counter claim
under sub-rule (1), if any, within the period of thirty days, the Presiding Officer may in exceptional cases and
special circumstances to be recorded in writing, extend the period, by such further period not exceeding fifteen
days.

(4) Tf the defendant have filed their claim for set off or counter claim, the applicant shall file reply statement in
answer to the claim for set off or counter claim within a period of thirty days of filing of such claims.

(5) If the applicant fails to file his reply within the period of thirty days, the Presiding Officer may, in
exceptional cases and special circumstances, to be recorded in writing, extend the period, by such further period
not exceeding fifteen days.

(6) The written statement of the defendant including claim for set off or counter claim or any other pleading
whatsoever by the defendant or the applicant, as the case may be, shall be supported by an affidavit sworn in by
the defendant or the applicant or the witnesses, verifying all the facts and pleadings and other documents
annexed and the affidavits of witnesses, to be led by defendant or the applicant shall be filed simultaneously
with the written statement of the defendant or the reply of the applicant.

(7) If the defendant or the applicant as the case may be, fails to file the reply as specified above, the Tribunal
may proceed forthwith to pass an order on the application as it thinks fit.

(8) Where a defendant makes an admission of the full or part of the amount of debt due to a bank or financial
institution, the Tribunal shall order such defendant, to pay such amount, to the extent of the admission, by the



[ I-@vs 3(i)] WA <h1 TSTIS : STHIENT 17

applicant within a period of thirty days from the date of such order, failing which the Tribunal may issue a
certificate in accordance with section 19 of the Act, to the extent of amount of debt due admitted by the
defendant.

(9) The Tribunal may at any time for sufficient reason order that any particular fact or facts shall be proved by
affidavit, or that the affidavit of any witness shall be read at the hearing, on such conditions as the Tribunal
thinks reasonable:

Provided that after filing of the affidavits by the respective parties where it appears to the Tribunal that
cither the applicant or the defendant desires the production of a witness for cross examination and that such
witness can be produced and it is necessary to do so, the Tribunal shall for sufficient reasons to be recorded,
order the witness to be present for cross examination, and in the event of the witness not appearing for cross
examination, then, the affidavit shall not be taken into evidence and further that no oral evidence other than that
given in this proviso will be permitted.

(10) If the defendant denies his liability to pay the claim made by the applicant, the Tribunal may act upon the

affidavit of the applicant who is acquainted with the facts of the case or who has on verification of the record
sworn the affidavit in respect of the contents of application and the documents as evidence.

(11) The provisions contained in section 4 of the Banker's Books Evidence Act, 1891 (18 of 1891) shall apply to
a certified copy of an entry in a banker's book furnished along with the application filed under sub-section (1) of
section 19 by the applicant.”. .

7. 1In the principal rules, for rule 16, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:—

“16. Communication of final orders to parties.— Every final order passed and recovery certificate issued shall be
communicated to the applicant and to the defendant cither in person or by registered post free of cost and may
also be uploaded in the website of the Tribunal:

Provided that the applicant and defendant may obtain copy of any other order passed by the Tribunal
during the hearing from the Registrar on payment of fees of rupees five per page, subject to a minimum of
rupees one hundred, for every order and the same may also be uploaded in the website of the Tribunal.”.

8. TIn the principal rules, in FORM I—

(a) under the heading ‘DETAILS OF APPLICATION’, after serial number 3 and entries relating thereto, the
following serial number and entries shall be inserted, namely:—

“3A. Details of debt and assets:

(i) Total amount of debt claimed as on the

date to be specified.

amount of debt, in

rupees

(ii) Amount of debt, as on specified date,
sccured by security interest over propertics or
assets of the defendant with particulars of
secured properties and assets.

amount of secured
debt, in rupees

description of property or
asset with its location
securing the debt.

(iii) Estimated value of properties or assets
over which security interest is created.

description of property
or asset with ifs
location securing the
debt.

value, in rupees

(iv) If estimated value is not adequate to cover
the total debt claimed with future interest
particulars of any other properties or assets
known to the applicant with estimated value
of such other properties or asscts.

description of property
or asset with its
location.

estimated value, in rupees

(v) Amount of unsecured debt or portion of
debt not covered by estimated value of
secured properties and other properties.

amount of unsecured
debt, in rupees

portion of debt not
covered by securities, in
rupees. ”’;

7

(b) for serial number 7 and entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be substituted,

namely:—

7. Interim order, if prayed for:—

(i) pending final decisions on the application,
the applicant seeks issue of the following

interim order:—

(Give here the nature of the interim order

prayed for with reasons)



18 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART [I—SEC. 3(i)]

(ii) whether the applicant is seeking an order
directing the defendant to disclose to the
Tribunal particulars of other properties or
assets owned by the defendant and if so,
grounds justifying such order.

(iii) if the applicant proposes to rely on
evidence of any witness in support of his
claim, he shall annex affidavits of the
witnesses, to the application.”;

(c) for serial number 10 and entries relating thereto, the following serial number and entries shall be substituted,
namely:—

“10. Details of documents:-

True copies of all documents and evidence of
witnesses along with an index of such
documents in duplicate, relied upon in support
of the claim.”

9. In the principal rules, after FORM III, the following FORM shall be inserted, namely:—
“FORM IV
(See sub-rule (2A) of rule 5)

Summons under sub-section (4) of section 19 of the Act, read with sub-rule (2A) of rule 5 of the Debt Recovery Tribunal
(Procedure) Rules, 1993.

Before Debts Recovery Tribunal
address

OANoTE:
Date
Applicant
Defendant(s)

Whereas, OA No. was listed before Hon’ble Presiding Officeron .................

Whereas, this Hon’ble Tribunal is pleased to issue summons/ notice on the said Application under section 19(4)
of the Act, (OA) filed against you for recovery of debts of . /- (application along with copies of documents etc.
annexed).

In accordance with sub-section (4) of section 19 of the Act, you, the defendants are directed as under:-

(1) to show cause within thirty days of the service of summons as to why relief prayed for should not be
granted;
(1) to disclose particulars of properties or assets other than properties and assets specified by the applicant

under serial number 3A of the original application;

(1it) you are restrained from dealing with or disposing of secured assets or such other assets and properties
disclosed under serial number 3A of the original application, pending hearing and disposal of the
application for attachment of properties;

(iv) you shall not transter by way of sale, lease or otherwise, except in the ordinary course of his business
any of the assets over which security interest is created and/ or other assets and properties specified or
disclosed under serial number 3A of the original application without the prior approval of the Tribunal;

) you shall be liable to account for the sale proceeds realised by sale of secured assets or other assets and
properties in the ordinary course of business and deposit such sale proceeds in the account maintained
with the bank or financial institutions holding security interest over such assets.

You are also directed to file the written statement with a copy thereof furnished to the applicant and to appear
before on at A.M. failing which the application shall be heard and decided in
your absence.

Given under my hand and seal of the Tribunal on this thersb daylefdam ey 20550
By Order of the Tribunal
Registrar

Debts Recovery Tribunal, ...........



=
[ 9T [I-Evs 3(i)] A T TSI @ STETERO 19
To
Defendants
15
2.
3

[F. No. 3/10/2016 — DRT]
Anandrao V. Patil, Jt. Secy.

Note : The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R
564(E), dated the 5" August, 1993 and lastly amended vide notification number G.S.R 407(E), dated the 6"
April, 2016.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. igitally si
< HARINDRA  Riiigeonsn

KUMAR 332?53.016.11.07 12:22:06



